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Gerald R. Ford International Airport Announces 
New Police Chief 

 
(Above): Interim CEO Brian Picardat swears in new Police Chief Bill Nowicki 

GRAND RAPIDS, Mich. – The Gerald R. Ford International Airport Authority (GFIA) announced today 
that William “Bill” Nowicki has been hired as its new Chief Airport Law Enforcement Officer.  

Nowicki, who comes to Gerald R. Ford International Airport after 27 years with the Grand Rapids 
Police Department, was officially sworn in today.     

“Bill is a tremendous addition to our airport staff and brings an array of law enforcement 
knowledge,” said GFIA Public Safety & Operations Director Lisa Carr. "Bill has an incredible resume 
and is well known and well respected among his peers. He brings a diverse set of experience and 
leadership to the department, and I am confident Bill will be a great fit with the team.” 

Nowicki has a Bachelor of Science in Criminal Justice and a Master of Science in Criminal Justice 
Administration from Ferris State University. He is also a graduate of the School of Police Staff and 
Command from Northwestern University, and a graduate of the Leadership Institute at Calvin 
College.  
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The St. Clair, Michigan native has an extensive background in law enforcement and has served as a 
Patrol Officer, Field Training Officer, Detective, and Patrol Sergeant.  In 2004 he was promoted to 
Lieutenant and in that role, he has served as a Watch Commander, Administrative Lieutenant, and 
since 2013 he has served as the Unit Commander of the Vice Unit.   

During his career at the Grand Rapids Police Department, Nowicki has received numerous awards 
including a Commendation Award, Team Performance Award, Achievement Award, Honorable 
Mention Award, four Unit Performance Awards, and many Letters of Commendation and 
Recognition.  Locally, Chief Nowicki serves on the Kent County Opioid Task Force, Illicit Massage 
Industry work group, City of Grand Rapids Human Trafficking Task Force, and Ferris State 
University’s School of Criminal Justice Alumni Advisory Committee. 

 “I am thrilled to join the Gerald R. Ford International Airport Authority team,” said Nowicki. “The 
airport continues to grow, and I am looking forward to bringing my skills and knowledge of public 
safety and law enforcement into a new environment where security is held to the highest standard.” 

“We pride ourselves on safety and security, and Bill’s experience will be a great fit in working with 
the Transportation Security Administration, Department of Homeland Security, and building our 
internal law enforcement department,” said Brian Picardat, Interim CEO at the Gerald R. Ford 
International Airport. 

Nowicki replaces Chief Rick Aro, who retired in March.   

### 

About GFIA 

The Gerald R. Ford International Airport (GFIA) is the second busiest airport in Michigan. The 
Airport served over 3.26 million passengers in 2018 and over 9,000 travelers pass through GFIA 
each day.  The Gerald R. Ford International Airport offers nonstop service to 31 major market 
destinations with more than 140 daily nonstop flights.  The Gerald R. Ford International Airport is 
managed and operated by the Gerald R. Ford International Airport Authority.  GFIA generates over 
$3.1 billion in annual economic output throughout West Michigan, and employs over 2,000 people.  
For more information on GFIA visit: www.flyford.org or follow the airport on Facebook, Instagram, 
and Twitter: @FlyGRFord 
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